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All activities are subject to change. Any necessary updates will be posted in calendar areas on 2nd & 3rd 

AD 1/2 Day
In the o�ce

11:00-3:00pm
 

11:30am -
Morning Exercise 
(2LR)

2:00pm -
Movie Matinee: It 
Happened One Night 
- 1934 (2LR) 
Tubi streaming app
When a brash reporter 
starts trailing a runaway 
heiress on her bus trip 
from Florida to New York 
for a big scoop, can love 
be far behind?

Saturday

10:30am -
Rosh Hashana 
Social (B)
In this collaborative 
event with our friends 
from JH, join us for 
snacks and discussion 
of this important 
holiday's traditions & 
customs!

11:30am - 
Walk & Roll Club (B)
Weather permitting we 
will move outdoors.

2:00pm -
Book Club (2L)
Bring a favorite book to 
share, or a notepad to jot 
down new 
recommendations!

3:00pm -
Rosh Hashana 
Service w/ Cantor 
Berg (1) 

3:30pm - 1:1 Visits 
w/ Heather (2&3)

Friday

10:00am -
Respiratory Health 
Class w/ Heather 
(3W)

10:45am - Dominoes 
(3W)

11:30am - Walk & 
Roll Club (3W)
This will be a *resident-
run* meeting of the club!

2:00pm - 
Let's Learn: The 
Voice and Aging 
(2DR)
Join as we review an 
academic article and 
discuss the importance 
of this topic at MP! 

3:00pm -
Rosh Hashana 
Service w/ Cantor 
Berg (1) 

3:30pm - Manicures 
w/ Heather (2&3)

Thursday

10:00am -
Respiratory Health 
Class w/ Heather 
(2LR)

10:45am - Pokeno 
(2DR)

11:30am - Walk & 
Roll Club (2LR)
Weather permitting we 
will move outdoors.

2:00pm -
Library Visit (3L)
Browse a variety of 
media selections from 
the Community Library 
of DeWitt & Jamesville.

3:00pm -
Rosh Hashana 
Service w/ Cantor 
Berg (1) 

3:30pm -1:1 Visits 
w/ Heather (2&3)

Wednesday

Happy Birthday 
Hannah G!

9:30am -
Seasonal Calendar 
Swap (2&3)

10:00am - Inn Group 
(3E)

11:15am - Walk & 
Roll Club (3W)
Weather permitting we 
will move outdoors.

2:00pm -
Outing: Marshalls 
(Sign-Up Required)

3:45pm - Surprise 
Snack Cart! (2&3)
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